The United Illuminating Company Docket No: 21-01-02

UI Standard Service RFP012021, B	idding Workbook							
,								
UI Standard Service Tranche	Tranche Definition		ık \$/MWh	Off Peak \$/MWh		\$/MWh	Total \$	
JI SS Tranche 1	July 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load	\$	74.92	\$ 75.06	\$	75.02		,262.57
JI SS Tranche 2	July 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load	\$		\$ -	\$		\$	
JI SS Tranche 3	July 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load	\$		\$ -	\$		\$	
JI SS Tranche 4 JI SS Tranche 5	Not used in this RFP	\$ \$	85.77	\$ - \$ 85.78	\$	85.78	\$ 0.570	,308.70
JI SS Tranche 6	January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load	\$	- 65.77	\$ 65.76	\$	- 65.76	\$ 6,572	,306.70
JI SS Tranche 7	January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load	\$		\$ -	\$		\$	
JI SS Tranche 8	Not used in this RFP	\$		\$ -	\$		\$	
Total	Not used in this IVI	ΙΨ		Ι Ψ	ļΨ			,571.27
							, ,,,,,,,,	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
	Bidder and Bid Identification	,						
	Blader and Bla Identification							
Scenario A - Bidder "G"								
D. I	DEDOLOGO LI L. L. O.							
Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder_workbook_	RFP012021_Linked_2							
Please select accordingly from the								
Drop Down List in the next cell	Yes this bid is Linked							
f "Yes this hid is linked" is chosen fro	as the Deep Decorpt is the hear shows the Tanashas is this way							
package. Linked Bids must be submi-	m the Drop Down List in the box above, the Tranches in this wor tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pric including and Unlined pricing in the same Workbook. Linkage many	ing for Trai	nches that	are part of the				
package. Linked Bids must be submi Linked package (i.e. do not combine L Service and Last Resort Service Bids		ing for Trai	nches that s over bet	are part of the ween Standard				
package. Linked Bids must be submi- Linked package (i.e. do not combine L Service and Last Resort Service Bids his Workbook. Regative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be acco	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pric- Linked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage may be used to the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, are workbook, RFP012021_1' (unlinked workbook) will be withdreable outcomes: If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unlepted If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unline	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work	nches that is over bet by individua e bids for a values in the	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Franches 1 & 5 his workbook Tranches				
package. Linked Bids must be submi Linked package (i.e. do not combine I Service and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. egative Contingent Bid. If the linked b submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder represent no bid. Below are the possi 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be acci from the unlinked workbook can indivi	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pric- Linked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage may be used to the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, are workbook, RFP012021_1' (unlinked workbook) will be withdreable outcomes: If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unlepted If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unline	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work	nches that is over bet by individua e bids for a values in the	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Franches 1 & 5 his workbook Tranches				
package. Linked Bids must be submi Linked package (i.e. do not combine I Service and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. egative Contingent Bid. If the linked b submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder represent no bid. Below are the possi 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be acci from the unlinked workbook can indivi	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pric- Linked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage may be used to the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, are workbook, RFP012021_1' (unlinked workbook) will be withdreable outcomes: If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unlepted If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unline	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work	nches that is over bet by individua e bids for a values in the	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Franches 1 & 5 his workbook Tranches				
package. Linked Bids must be submitative package (i.e. do not combine Leservice and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. Begative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder represent no bid. Below are the possifunction to be unlinked workbook can individually be according to the unlinked workbook.	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pric- Linked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage may be used to the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, are workbook, RFP012021_1' (unlinked workbook) will be withdreable outcomes: If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unlepted If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unline	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	e bids for Tanches	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Franches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7	ur unique	alpha-n	numeric identif	ier
cackage. Linked Bids must be submi- Linked package (i.e. do not combine I Service and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. Legative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder represent no bid. Below are the possi 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accorrom the unlinked workbook can indivi Additional Instructions: 1. DO NOT USE SAMPLE BIDDER provided by UI. Price quotes provided	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this b	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	e bids for Tanches	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Franches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7	ur unique	alpha-n	numeric identif	ier
cackage. Linked Bids must be submicinked package (i.e. do not combine Loservice and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. Legative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder represent no bid. Below are the possifunction to be under the possifunction of the unlinked workbook can individually be according to th	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, by workbook_RFP012021_1 ' (unlinked workbook) will be withdrable outcomes:- If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unleaded If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlinedually be accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Up in any other format will not be accepted.	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	nches that is over bet is over bet is over bet e bids for T values in ti kbook for T for Tranche	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you				ier
cackage. Linked Bids must be submicinked package (i.e. do not combine Linked package (i.e. do not combine Linked package (i.e. do not combine Linked package). Service and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. Legative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - ULSS_Bidder expresent no bid. Below are the possifut, 2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent the unlinked workbook can individually be accurrent the unlinked workbook can individually be accurrent to the unlinked workbook	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can price the cell above does not say "Yes this b	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an , alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	nches that is over bet is over bet is over bet e bids for T values in ti kbook for T for Tranche	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you				ier
cackage. Linked Bids must be submitative package (i.e. do not combine Linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possifunction of the unlinked workbook can individually be accidented by UI. Price quotes provided by UI. Price quotes provided by UI. Price quotes provided Make no 3 Do not enter pricing on this page.	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, by workbook_RFP012021_1 ' (unlinked workbook) will be withdrable outcomes:- If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unleaded If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlineated If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlineated by accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Upon any other format will not be accepted. changes in other cells. Pricing on this page populates automatically. Enter pricing in tall.	ing for Trai ay not cros urchase an alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	nches that is over bett is over bett is over bett e bids for a values in the thook for T for Tranche	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you in this Workbook	c. Workt	oook rou	nds prices to	
package. Linked Bids must be submit Linked package (i.e. do not combine Linked package). Begative Contingent Bid. If the linked besubmitted in 'Bidder G - UL_SS_Bidde represent no bid. Below are the possiful,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accifrom the unlinked workbook can individually be accifrom the	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, by workbook_RFP012021_1 ' (unlinked workbook) will be withdrable outcomes:- If no linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unleaded If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlinedually be accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Up in any other format will not be accepted.	ing for Tratay not cross your chase an alternative awn. Zero inked work niked bids for each bids for each and for both	nches that is over bet is over bet is over bet e bids for T values in t dbook for T for Tranche Bidder W n Tranche	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you in this Workbook	c. Workt	oook rou	nds prices to	
cackage. Linked Bids must be submicinked package (i.e. do not combine Linked package). Begative Contingent Bid. If the linked besubmitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder peresent no bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accommended by Linked workbook can individually be accommended by UI. Price quotes provided by UI. Price quotes provided by UI. Price quotes provided 2. Modify yellow cells only. Make no a Do not enter pricing on this page. The provided by UI. Price quoted, make survary on this basis (i.e. suppliers are not submit multiple notebooks as desi	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing on the bids in unlapted. If the linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unlapted. If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlined dually be accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Used in any other format will not be accepted. changes in other cells. Pricing on this page populates automatically. Enter pricing in tall the prices are populated for every month, each customer class and the cell above the cell above the cell and th	ing for Trait ay not cros yrchase an alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f	nches that so over bet so over bet e bids for T values in t dbook for T or Tranche Bidder W Tranche peak and ne of use).	are part of the ween Standard al Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook Tranches 2 & 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you in this Workbook off peak periods	. Workb	oook rou rer, price	nds prices to	e to
cackage. Linked Bids must be submitionable package (i.e. do not combine Leservice and Last Resort Service Bids his Workbook. Regative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possible promitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possible promitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possible promitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidder epresent no bid. Below are the possible promitted by Tr. 2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurated to the unlinked workbook can individually be accurated by UI. Price quotes provided	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage mail. If the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can pricing on the cell say the cell above does not say the c	ing for Trai ay not cross yurchase an alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f bs for each and for both honth or tim a "stand-a s taking ge	nches that is over bethe so ov	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you off peak periods ependent Bid unlivervice from entit	c. Workb . Howev ess "Bid ies other	rer, price	nds prices to es do not have " or "Negative	to
cackage. Linked Bids must be submicinked package (i.e. do not combine Linked between the combine of the comb	ted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage managements of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, any offerings for Tranches 1 & 5 from this workbook are accepted, any offerings for Tranches 1 & 1 from the linked bid is accepted, any of the bids in unleaded. If the linked bid is accepted for Tranches 1 & 5, only unlined by the accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Under the linked bid is accepted. WORKBOOK FROM RFP DOCUMENTS TO SUBMIT BIDS. Under the linked bid is accepted. Changes in other cells. Pricing on this page populates automatically. Enter pricing in tale prices are populated for every month, each customer classes, management of the linked bid is accepted by the linked bid is accepted. Changes in other cells. Pricing on this page populates automatically. Enter pricing in tale prices are populated for every month, each customer classes, management of the linked bid is accepted. Changes in other cells. Pricing on this page populates automatically. Enter pricing in tale to obligate to differentiate pricing between customer classes, management of the product of hourly total UI load (including customers) migration percentages (percentage of customers in each Customers)	ing for Trai ay not cros yurchase an alternative awn. Zero inked work nked bids f bs for each and for both honth or tim a "stand-a	nches that is over better by individual in the bids for Tyalues in the book for Tranche and Tranche peak and ne of use). Ione," indeeneration sistaking ge	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook ranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you off peak periods ependent Bid unleavice from entit neration service	. Howevers "Bid ies other from UI)	rer, price Linkage	nds prices to es do not have " or "Negative) for 12/1/201	to
package. Linked Bids must be submit Linked package (i.e. do not combine I Service and Last Resort Service Bids this Workbook. egative Contingent Bid. If the linked be submitted in 'Bidder G - UI_SS_Bidde represent no bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent to bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent to bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent to bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent to bid. Below are the possil 1,2,3,5,6, or 7 can individually be accurrent to be accurrent	tted in a separate, stand-alone Workbook that only contains pricinked and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage made and Unlinked pricing in the same Workbook). Linkage made are under the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide a support of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide a support of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide a support of the cell above does not say "Yes this bid is linked," UI can provide a support of the cell and the	ing for Traitay not cross and cross	nches that is over better by individual individual in the bids for Tyalues in the book for Tranche in Tranche in the book for Tranche individual individua	are part of the ween Standard al Tranche in Tranches 1 & 5 his workbook tranches es 2,3,6, or 7 orkbook with you off peak periods ependent Bid unlearning from entity neration service reach Tranche a	ess "Bid ies other from UI)	pook rou rer, price Linkage than UI	nds prices to es do not have " or "Negative) for 12/1/201 quantities.	9 -

		OTAL quantities for	or evaluation		
Small_CI	Large_CI	Residential	StreetLight	Total	
19,132	2,784	59,497		81,413	
16,179	2,303	48,958	-	67,440	
14,201	2,248	35,976		52,425	
12,863	2,041	26,176	-	41,080	
11,704	2,049	27,378	-	41,131	
13,550	2,213	34,847	-	50,610	33,409.90
13,415	2,093	37,100	-	52,608	
11,809	1,876	28,192	-	41,877	
12,318	1,962	25,674	-	39,954	
10,926	1,851	23,891	-	36,668	
9,676	1,817	22,394	-	33,887	
14,805	2,359	37,470	-	54,634	25,962.80
160,578	25,596	407,553	-	593,727	
OF	F PEAK MWh T	OTAL quantities f	or evaluation		
Small_CI	Large_CI	Residential	StreetLight	Total	
33,421	6,915	150,861	1,103	192,300	
32,011	6,493	145,155	932	184,591	
25,683	5,803	99,092	1,048	131,626	
25,973	5,689	82,251	1,235	115,148	
25,539	5,886	81,594	1,427	114,446	
30,179	6,391	102,704	1,937	141,211	87,932.20
28,440	5,848	103,678	1,859	139,825	
26,496	5,479	87,505	1,531	121,011	
	5,800		1,385		
		79.266	1,254		
		80.200			
					73,974.80
326,491	71,272	1,205,289	16,018	1,619,070	
487 069	96,868	1.612.842	16.018	2.212.797	
7,222		7. 7.	.,.	7 7 -	
	16,179 14,201 12,863 11,704 13,550 13,415 11,809 12,318 10,926 9,676 14,805 160,578 OF Small_Cl 33,421 32,011 25,683 25,973 25,539 30,179 28,404 26,496 26,897 22,385	19,132 2,784 16,179 2,303 14,201 2,248 12,863 2,041 11,704 2,049 13,550 2,213 13,415 2,093 11,809 1,876 12,318 1,962 10,926 1,851 9,676 1,817 14,805 2,359 160,578 25,596 OFF PEAK MWh 1 Small_Cl Large_Cl 33,421 6,915 33,011 6,493 25,683 5,803 25,973 5,689 25,539 5,886 30,179 6,391 28,440 5,848 26,496 5,479 26,897 5,800 22,547 5,248 22,385 5,634 26,920 6,086	19,132 2,784 59,497 16,179 2,303 48,958 14,201 2,248 35,976 12,863 2,041 26,176 11,704 2,049 27,378 13,550 2,213 34,847 13,415 2,093 37,100 11,809 1,876 28,192 12,318 1,962 25,674 10,926 1,851 23,891 9,676 1,817 22,394 14,805 2,359 37,470 160,578 25,596 407,553 OFF PEAK MWh TOTAL quantities f Small_Cl Large_Cl Residential 33,421 6,915 150,861 32,011 6,493 145,155 25,683 5,803 99,092 25,973 5,689 82,251 25,539 5,886 81,594 30,179 6,391 102,704 28,440 5,848 103,674 26,896 5,479 87,505 26,897 5,800 89,237 22,547 5,248 79,266 22,385 5,634 80,200 26,920 6,086 103,746 326,491 71,272 1,205,289	19,132	19,132

The United Illuminating Company Public Version UI Attachment 2a Docket No: 21-01-02 UI Attachment 2a

DOCKET NO. 21-01-02	CONFIDENTIAL UNTIL 04/27/2021												ITIAL UNTIL	04/27/202	1			
		I	IAL OITH	L 0-1/21/1							T 00.	11 IDEI	I IAL OITHL	04/21/202				
UI SS Tranche 1	July 1, 2021 t	hrough D	ecember 3	1, 2021 - 1	0% of the	SS TOTAL	load											
		PEAK M	Wh			On Peak Bid Pr	ice Per MWh	(\$/M\	Wh)	Peak Bid Price Times MWh (\$/MWh)								
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residenti	al	Street Lights	Small C&I	Lar	ge C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total		
July-2021	1,913	278	5,950	-	\$ 68.2	0 \$ 68.20	\$ 68	20	N/A	\$ 130,480.24	\$	18,986.88	\$ 405,769.54	N/A	\$	555,236.66		
August-2021	1,618	230	4,896	-	\$ 68.7	1 \$ 68.71	\$ 68	71	N/A	\$ 111,165.91	\$	15,823.91	\$ 336,390.42	N/A	\$	463,380.24		
September-2021	1,420	225	3,598	-	\$ 83.2	6 \$ 83.26	\$ 83	26	N/A	\$ 118,237.53	\$	18,716.85	\$ 299,536.18	N/A	\$	436,490.56		
October-2021	1,286	204	2,618	-	\$ 50.2	9 \$ 50.29	\$ 50	29	N/A	\$ 64,688.03	\$	10,264.19	\$ 131,639.10	N/A	\$	206,591.32		
November-2021	1,170	205	2,738	-	\$ 88.6	4 \$ 88.64	\$ 88	64	N/A	\$ 103,744.26	\$	18,162.34	\$ 242,678.59	N/A	\$	364,585.19		
December-2021	1,355	221	3,485	-	\$ 94.2	4 \$ 94.24	\$ 94	24	N/A	\$ 127,695.20	\$	20,855.31	\$ 328,398.13	N/A	\$	476,948.64		
Totals	8,763	1,364	23,283	-						\$ 656,011.17	\$	102,809.48	\$ 1,744,411.96	N/A	\$	2,503,232.61		
Total Peak MWh	33,410																	
		OFF PEAK	MWh			Off Peak Bid Pr	ice Per MWh	(\$/M\	Wh)	Off Peak Bid Price Times MWh (\$/MWh)								
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residenti	al	Street Lights	Small C&I	Lar	ge C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total		
July-2021	3,342	692	15,086	110	\$ 68.2	0 \$ 68.20	\$ 68	20 \$	\$ 68.20	\$ 227,931.22	\$	47,160.30	\$ 1,028,872.02	\$ 7,522.4	6 \$	1,311,486.00		
August-2021	3,201	649	14,516	93	\$ 68.7	1 \$ 68.71	\$ 68	71 \$	\$ 68.71			44,613.40		\$ 6,403.7	7 \$	1,268,324.76		
September-2021	2,568	580	9,909	105	\$ 83.2	6 \$ 83.26	\$ 83	26	\$ 83.26	\$ 213,836.66	\$	48,315.78	\$ 825,039.99	\$ 8,725.6	5 \$	1,095,918.08		
October-2021	2,597	569	8,225	124	\$ 50.2	9 \$ 50.29	\$ 50	29 \$	\$ 50.29	\$ 130,618.22	\$	28,609.98		\$ 6,210.8	2 \$	579,079.30		
November-2021	2,554	589	8,159	143	\$ 88.6	4 \$ 88.64	\$ 88	64	\$ 88.64	\$ 226,377.70	\$	52,173.50	\$ 723,249.22	\$ 12,648.9	3 \$	1,014,449.35		
December-2021	3,018	639	10,270	194	\$ 94.2	4 \$ 94.24	\$ 94	24 \$	\$ 94.24	\$ 284,406.90	\$	60,228.78	\$ 967,882.50	\$ 18,254.2	9 \$	1,330,772.47		
Totals	17,281	3,718	66,166	768						\$ 1,303,118.28	\$	281,101.74	\$ 4,956,044.02	\$ 59,765.9	2 \$	6,600,029.96		
Total Off Peak MWh	87,932																	
UI SS Tranche 1	Total \$'s	\$/MWh				Bidder Identif	ication						Bidder Ide	entification	l			
Total Peak Bid	\$ 2,503,232.61	\$ 74.92																
						٥								•				
Total Off Peak Bid	\$ 6,600,029.96					O O O	"O"				_			0				
Total Bid	\$ 9,103,262.57	\$ 75.02		If "Voc this		Scenario A - Bio		n Da	own Liet in the		Scenario A - Bidder "G"					ict in the boy		
					If "Yes this bid is linked" is chosen from the Drop Down List in the box above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a						If "Yes this bid is linked" is chosen from the Drop Down List in the brabove, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a							
				-	July 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load							July 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load						

121,342

Total MWh

Docket No: 21-01-02

	CO	NFIDENT	IAL UNT		CONFIDENTIAL UNTIL 04/27/2021									
			L.,										₩	
UI SS Tranche 2	July 1, 2021	through D	ecember 3	1, 2021 - 1 <mark>0%</mark>	of the	SS TOTAL	load							
		PEAK N	1Wh			On Peak Bid Pr	ice Per MWh (\$/	MWh)						
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights Sm	nall C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total
July-2021	1,913	278	5,950	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
August-2021	1,618	230	4,896	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
September-2021	1,420	225	3,598	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
October-2021	1,286	204	2,618	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
November-2021	1,170	205	2,738	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
December-2021	1,355	221	3,485	- \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
Totals	8,763	1,364	23,283	-					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-
Total Peak MWh	33,410)											#	
		OFF PEAR	(MWh			Off Peak Bid Pri	ce Per MWh (\$/	 MWh)		Off Peak Bid Price	+-			
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights Sm	nall C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total
July-2021	3,342	692	15,086	110 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
August-2021	3,201	649	14,516	93 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
September-2021	2,568	580	9,909	105 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
October-2021	2,597	569	8,225	124 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	
November-2021	2,554	589	8,159	143 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
December-2021	3,018	639	10,270	194 \$	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
Totals	17,281	3,718	66,166	768					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-
Total Off Peak MWh	87,932	,											+-	
Total on Foak intri	01,002													
UI SS Tranche 2	Total \$'s	\$/MWh		_		Bidder Identif	ication				Bidder Id	entification		
Total Peak Bid	\$ -	\$ -		_						_				
Total Off Peak Bid	\$ -	\$ -				0						0		
Total Bid	\$ -	\$ -				cenario A - Bio						- Bidder "G"		
								Down List in the			s linked" is chosen			
				box above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purch										
				July 1, 2021 tl	hrough D	ecember 31, 202	1 - 10% of the S	S TOTAL load		July 1, 2021	through December 3	1, 2021 - 10% of the	SS TOTA	L load
Total MWh	121,342	<u> </u>	I											

Tranche_2 4 of 8

Docket No: 21-01-02

	CON	IFIDENT	IAL UNTI	L 04/27/2	2021					CONFIDE	NTIAL UNTIL	04/27/2021				
UI SS Tranche 3	July 1, 2021 t	hrough De	ecember 3	1, 2021 - 1	0% of the	SS TOTAL	load									
		PEAK M	Wh			On Peak Bid Pr	rice Per MWh (\$	MWh)								
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Total			
July-2021	1,913	278	5,950	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
August-2021	1,618	230	4,896	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
September-2021	1,420	225	3,598	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
October-2021	1,286	204	2,618	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
November-2021	1,170	205	2,738	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
December-2021	1,355	221	3,485	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
Totals	8,763	1,364	23,283	-					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -			
Total Peak MWh	33,410															
		OFF PEAK	MWh			Off Peak Bid Pr	ice Per MWh (\$/	MWh)		Off Peak Bid Price	Times MWh (\$/MWh)					
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Total			
July-2021	3,342	692	15,086	110	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
August-2021	3,201	649	14,516	93	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
September-2021	2,568	580	9,909	105	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
October-2021	2,597	569	8,225	124	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
November-2021	2,554	589	8,159	143	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
December-2021	3,018	639	10,270	194	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
Totals	17,281	3,718	66,166	768					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			
Total Off Peak MWh	87,932															
UI SS Tranche 3	Total \$'s	\$/MWh			ı	 Bidder Identif	fication	Į		Bidder Identification						
Total Peak Bid	\$ -	\$ -														
Total Off Peak Bid	s -	s -				0						1				
Total Bid	\$ -	\$ -			9	cenario A - Bi	dder "G"				Scenario A	•				
Total Blu	-	a -		If "Yes this				Down List in the		If "Yes this bid	is linked" is chosen		own List in the box			
								purchased as a			Tranches in this wo					
				·							through December 31					
Total MWh	121,342]]						

Tranche_3 5 of 8

The United Illuminating Company Public Version UI Attachment 2a

Docket No: 21-01-02

		CONFIDE	NTI	AL UNTIL	04/27/2021													
UI SS Tranche 5	January 1, 20	22 throug	h June 30,	2022 - 10	% of the	SS TOTA	AL load											
		PEAK M	Wh			On Peak Bid Price Per MWh (\$/MWh)				Peak Bid Price Times N			s MWh (\$/MWh)					
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&	Large C&	Residential	Street	Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I		Residential	Street Lights		Total		
January-2022	1,342	209	3,710	-	\$ 113.23	3 \$ 113.	23 \$ 113.2	3 N	I/A	\$ 151,898.05	\$ 23,699.04	\$	420,083.30	N/A	\$	595,680.39		
February-2022	1,181	188	2,819	-	\$ 114.5	4 \$ 114.	54 \$ 114.5	1 N	I/A	\$ 135,260.29	\$ 21,487.70	\$	322,911.17	N/A	\$	479,659.16		
March-2022	1,232	196	2,567	-	\$ 91.18	8 \$ 91.	18 \$ 91.1	3 N	I/A	\$ 112,315.52	\$ 17,889.52	\$	234,095.53	N/A	\$	364,300.57		
April-2022	1,093	185	2,389	-	\$ 58.8	8 \$ 58.	38 \$ 58.8	3 N	I/A	\$ 64,332.29	\$ 10,898.69	\$	140,670.21	N/A	\$	215,901.19		
May-2022	968	182	2,239	-	\$ 72.0	7 \$ 72.	72.0	7 N	I/A	\$ 69,734.93	\$ 13,095.12	\$	161,393.56	N/A	\$	244,223.61		
June-2022	1,481	236	3,747	-	\$ 59.8	7 \$ 59.	37 \$ 59.8	7 N	I/A	\$ 88,637.54	\$ 14,123.33	\$	224,332.89	N/A	\$	327,093.76		
Totals	7,295	1,196	17,472	-						\$ 622,178.62	\$ 101,193.40	\$	1,503,486.66	N/A	\$	2,226,858.68		
Total Peak MWh	25,963											_						
											Off Peak Bid Price							
		OFF PEAK				Off Peak Bi	d Price Per MWh	(\$/MWh)			,							
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&			Street	Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I		Residential	Street Lights		Total		
January-2022	2,844	585	10,368	186	\$ 113.2	_+						_	1,173,945.99	\$ 21,049.46	_	1,583,238.47		
February-2022	2,650	548	8,751	153	\$ 114.5	4 \$ 114.	54 \$ 114.5	1 \$	114.54	\$ 303,485.18	\$ 62,756.47	\$	1,002,282.27		\$	1,386,059.99		
March-2022	2,690	580	8,924	139	\$ 91.18	_+		3 \$		\$ 245,246.85	\$ 52,884.40		813,662.97	, , , , , ,	-	1,124,422.65		
April-2022	2,255	525	7,927	125	\$ 58.8	8 \$ 58.	38 \$ 58.8	3 \$	58.88	\$ 132,756.74	\$ 30,900.22	-	466,718.21	\$ 7,383.55	-	637,758.72		
May-2022	2,239	563	8,020	122	\$ 72.0	_+		7 \$		\$ 161,328.70	\$ 40,604.24		578,001.40			788,734.09		
June-2022	2,692	609	10,375	109	\$ 59.8	7 \$ 59.	37 \$ 59.8	7 \$	59.87	\$ 161,170.04	\$ 36,436.88	\$	621,127.30	\$ 6,501.88	\$	825,236.10		
Totals	15,369	3,410	54,363	834						\$ 1,326,013.63	\$ 289,799.11	\$	4,655,738.14	\$ 73,899.14	\$	6,345,450.02		
Total Off Peak MWh	73,975														-			
UI SS Tranche 5	Total \$'s	\$/MWh				Bidder Ide	ntification				Bidder Identification							
Total Peak Bid	\$ 2,226,858,68	\$ 85.77		-					•									
Total Founding	Ψ Σ,ΣΣΟ,ΟΟΟ.ΟΟ	V 00		-							-							
Total Off Peak Bid	\$ 6,345,450.02	\$ 85.78				C								0				
Total Bid	\$ 8,572,308.70	\$ 85.78				Scenario A								- Bidder "G"				
				If "Yes this	bid is link	ed" is chose	n from the Dro	p Down Lis	st in the		If "Yes this bid i	is linl	ked" is chosen	from the Drop Do	own L	ist in the box		
				box above,	the Tranc	hes in this w	orkbook must	be purchas	sed as a		above, the	Tran	ches in this wo	rkbook must be p	ourcha	ased as a		
				January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load							January 1,	2022	through June 30	2022 - 10% of the S	S TOT	AL load		
Total MWh	99,938																	

Tranche_5 6 of 8

Docket No: 21-01-02

	CON		CONFIDE	NTIAL UNTIL	04/27/2021											
UI SS Tranche 6	January 1, 20	22 throug	<u>h June 30,</u>	2022 - 10	% of the	SS TOTAL	. load									
		PEAK M	Wh			On Peak Bid I	Price Per MWh (\$	/MWh)		Peak Bid Price T	Peak Bid Price Times MWh (\$/MWh)					
Month	Month Small C&I Large C&I Residential Street Lig				Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total		
January-2022	1,342	209	3,710	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-		
February-2022	1,181	188	2,819		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-		
March-2022	1,232	196	2,567	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$			
April-2022	1,093	185	2,389		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-		
May-2022	968	182	2,239	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$			
June-2022	1,481	236	3,747	-	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-		
Totals	7,295	1,196	17,472	-					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	N/A	\$	-		
Total Peak MWh	25,963															
		OFF PEAK	MWh			Off Peak Bid F	 Price Per MWh (\$	/MWh)		Off Peak Bid Price	Times MWh (\$/MWh)					
Month	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I		Residential	Street Lights	Small C&I	Large C&I	Residential	Street Lights		Total		
January-2022	2,844	585	10,368	186	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$			
February-2022	2,650	548	8,751	153	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$			
March-2022	2,690	580	8,924	139	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-		
April-2022	2,255	525	7,927	125	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-		
May-2022	2,239	563	8,020	122	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$			
June-2022	2,692	609	10,375	109	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$			
Totals	15,369	3,410	54,363	834					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-		
Total Off Peak MWh	73,975															
Total on Feak WWW	70,070															
UI SS Tranche 6	Total \$'s	\$/MWh				Bidder Ident	ification				Bidder Ide	entification	•			
Total Peak Bid	\$ -	\$ -														
Total Off Peak Bid	\$ -	\$ -				0				_		0				
Total Bid	\$ -	\$ -		16 113 (11) -		Scenario A - E		D		16 10 6 - 4 6 1 - 6 1 4 1		- Bidder "G"		to the beau		
								Down List in the purchased as a		If "Yes this bid is linked" is chosen from the Drop Down List in the box above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a						
				-			22 - 10% of the S	•		_	2022 through June 30					
Total MWh	99,938			1]						

The United Illuminating Company Public Version UI Attachment 2a

Docket No: 21-01-02 **CONFIDENTIAL UNTIL 04/27/2021 CONFIDENTIAL UNTIL 04/27/2021** UI SS Tranche 7 January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load **PEAK MWh** Peak Bid Price Times MWh (\$/MWh) Small C&I Large C&I Residential Street Lights Small C&I Large C&I Residential Street Lights Total anuary-2022 1,342 209 N/A ebruary-2022 1,181 188 2,819 N/A March-2022 1,232 196 2,567 N/A \$ N/A April-2022 1,093 185 2,389 N/A N/A 182 N/A N/A /lay-2022 968 2,239 \$ \$ N/A 1,481 236 3,747 - \$ \$ N/A June-2022 Totals 7,295 1,196 17,472 \$ N/A Total Peak MWh 25,963 OFF PEAK MWh Off Peak Bid Price Times MWh (\$/MWh) Off Peak Bid Price Per MWh (\$/MWh) Month Small C&I Large C&I Residential Street Lights Small C&I Large C&I Residential Street Lights Total January-2022 2,844 585 10,368 186 2,650 548 8,751 153 ebruary-2022 580 139 March-2022 2,690 8,924 \$ \$ April-2022 2,255 525 7,927 125 - \$ -\$ -\$ /lay-2022 2,239 563 8,020 122 - \$ \$ \$ 109 2.692 609 10.375 \$ \$ une-2022 \$ Totals 15,369 3,410 54,363 834 - \$ \$ \$ 73,975 Total Off Peak MWh UI SS Tranche 7 Total \$'s \$/MWh **Bidder Identification Bidder Identification** otal Peak Bid Total Off Peak Bid 0 0 Total Bid Scenario A - Bidder "G" Scenario A - Bidder "G"

If "Yes this bid is linked" is chosen from the Drop Down List in the

box above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a

January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load

Total MWh

99.938

If "Yes this bid is linked" is chosen from the Drop Down List in the box

above, the Tranches in this workbook must be purchased as a

January 1, 2022 through June 30, 2022 - 10% of the SS TOTAL load